RULZ AND REGULATION No.

174 PAGE

APPENDIX

to Rule 001, subsections 001.01, 001.02G,

existing subsections.

1. Make the following revisions
001.02H, 001.03 and renumber
001 SCOPE, DEFINITIONS, AND STATE CODES:

001.01

Scope and Application: All rules, regulations, and orders of

the Department of Health and Human Services Regulaticn and Licensure or

its
the
Service
housing

amended,

001,03

predecessor agency adopted prior to May 1,
powers,

1998, in connection with
duties, and functions transferred to the Nebraska Public
Commission under the Nebraska Uniform Standards for Modular
Units Act, shall continue to be effective until revised,

repealed, or nullified pursuant to law.

001.026 1Initial Package shall mean the materials required for
submission to the Department by a manufacturer who plans to
market or manufacture modular housing units in Nebraska and is
applying for seals to put on them, based on a showing that its
use of proposed plans and specifications will produce modular
housing units which meet the applicable standards. Each ini-
tial package shall consist of:

001.0261 Two coplies of the compliance assurance
manual (subsection 003.01B):

001.02G2 Two copies of the plans and specifications
for each modular housing unit model (subsections
003.04);

001.02G3 A completed application for Medular-Heousing

Baits—k plan #Aapproval ¥form MEB~81) prescribed by
the Commission;

001.02G4 A completed application for seals -H40p-52
on a ferm prescribed by the Commission; and

001 nR1 T3 spg vy e dde o B A bt B3y BOrEl-on £ a—yoaediat oy PEP=
Ty PR e o L e o e S N T LR Al SACE R S A s b EANe e 1 IA A g g S s Sy 25 A v
EE- PO ETY O IF SR O0S SNE NP SN PN PN S P NPT S I S S dlabdeoa damelaadd e ot oo
LAt T e e T T e o i i g e G B T O S S e i PR e S en s
Loy o] P N e o Jed-136 Sne—sana-Eatbt it on—fer—-— e B WY
TOE—Ox PRy ooy AL S AT I A el e e o e = o 3 s S e B A s R 1A 2 T rHCHT

%M:—amﬂ—y——.

Standards for Modular Housing Units: Except as provided by

statute, the follewing standards are hereby adopted as the State of
Nebraska Standards governing all &he construction of and all—the

installation of plumbing,

heating, and electrical systems in modular

3

housing units.

001.03A INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE - 2600 2009 EDITION,
published by the International Code Council, Inc., 5263
Leeskarg—Pike-Suite—708—Falls—Chureh, Virginia—2i2641-3401

as

500




RULE AND REGULATION No. 174 PAGE 4

New Jersey Avenue NW, 6" Floor, Washington DC 20001, and made a
part herecf by reference with the following revisions and
amendments. A copy of this code is available to be viewed at
the Nebraska Public Service Commission office at 300 The
Atrium, 1200 N Street, Lincoln, Nebraska, during normal
business hours.

001.C3A1 Omit Chapter 1 entirely.

001.03A2 In Chapter 3, Section R301.2, ramove the
last sentence.

001.03A3 1In Chapter 3, Table R301.2 (1), the value
for “Reef Ground Snow Load” shall be 30 psf, “Wind
Design Speed (mph)” shall be 90 mph, =nd “Wind Design
Topographic Effects” shall ke “No”, “Seismic Design
Category” shall be “C”. “Winter Design Temp” shall
be “-47, “Tce Barrier Underlayment Required” shall be
“Yes” and “Air Freezing Index” shall be “2500”, and
"Mean Annual Temp” shall be “50”.Footnote e “g”,
second sentence shall read, “Wind exposure category

shall be “C~.

001.03A4 1In Chapter 3, Table R301.45, change the
value for “Sleeping rooms” to 40,

001.03A5 In Chapter 3, Section R311.7.9%, add
"alternating tread devices" immediately after "Spiral

stairways”.

001.03A5a In Chapter 3, add a new section
R311.7.9.3 to read, “R311.7.9.3 Alternating
Tread Devices. Alternating tread devices
are limited to providing access to a space
of not mere than 70 square feet and such
space shall not provide access to any other
space or habitable room. Construction of
handrails and Lreads shall be in confor-
mance with the International Building Code,
2009 Rdition, Sections 1009.10.1 and
1008.10.2 {(Delete the “Exception” in
Section 1009.10.2)."

G01.03n6 In Chapter 3, omit Section R313 entirely,

001.03A47 In Chapter 9, Section R905.2.7.1, remove
all words prior to and including the first comma (,)
and capitalize the “a” in “an”.

001.03A58 In Chapter 11, Section N1101.2, retain
only the section’s first sentence and replace the
remainder of the section with, “The climate zone for
all of Nebraska is B4 “5” The climate zone for

homes to be located outside cof Nebraska shall be



RULE AND REGULATION No. 174 PAGE 5

determined by the site’s authority having Jjurisdic-

. "

tion”.

003 TARe RN STV 1 =N =t I e R | FAFmE ESNR w2 B I T S | 4 1 DALY S Ty
GH-J3Ne—In—Chapter d-pBeettron—P34-03+l—the-—rnumber

A ” - 2 1 5

M Lo b on A e gm0 = b 2 Ioerin o e o FF £V
EREE =% $18 A nyy LR S L P I S 4 1 R i e e e v (SIT AT = F AT AT =AY p i
aearrm ot o £

L= L LIS B EES Gy Wl ui ol i 0 v O 0

001.03A49 In Chapter 24, omit exceptions 3 and 4 in

Section G2406,2.

001.03A€10 Omit Chapters 33, 234, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39,

40, 11, ame 42 and 43.
G01.03A811 Adopt Appendix A, B, amd C and K.

001.03B  INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, 2888 2009 Edition, as
published by the International Code Council, Inc., 5283-lLees—
bueg-Pike Suite-708—Fatis—Ehureh,—Virginia,—226041~3401 500 New
Jersey Avenue NW, 6™ Floor, Washington DC 20001, made part
hereof by reference with the following revisions and amend-
ments. This code shall be used only for buildings that are not
detached one- and two-family dwellings and multiple single-
family dwellings (townhouses) not more than three stories high
with separate means of egress. A copy of this code is avail-
able to be viewed at the Nebraska Public Service Commission
cfifice at 300 The Atrium, 1200 N Street, Lincoln, Nebraska,
during normal business hours.

001.C3B1 In Chapter 1, omit Sections 101.1,

Fod--4--34101 .2, 103, 104, 105, 86+ 107, 108, 109, 110,
111, 112, 113, 114, ard 115 and 16.

0CG1.03C INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE, 2686 2009 Edition, as

pub-lished by the International Code Council, Inc., 5282

Suite—t08—Fatls Churehr—Virginia, 220433401 500
New Jersey Avenue NW, 6" Floor, Washington DC 20001, made a
part hercof by reference with the following revisions and
amendments. This code shall be used only for buildings that
are not detached one-~ and two-family dwellings and multiple
single-family dwellings (townhouses) not more than three
stories high with separate means of egress. A copy of this
code is available to be viewed at the Nebraska Public Service
Commission office at 300 The Atrium, 1200 N Street, Lincoln,
Nebraska, during normal business hours.

I ooz gl
E=ASAS S P g O iy s o iS [ = i g o S

001.03C1 In Chapter 1, omit Sections 101.1, 102,
103, 1064, 105, 106, 107, 108, ane-109 and 110.

001.03C2 Adopt Appendix D, F and G.



RULE AND REGULATION No. 174 PAGE o

001.030 RATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE, adopted ky the Nebraska
State Electrical Board in 100 NAC 18 pursuant to Nebraska
Revised Statutes Section 81-2104, issued and adepted by the
National Fire Protection Association in Publication Number 70
is made a part herecof by reference. & copy of this code is
available to be viewed at the Nebraska Public Service Com-
mission office at 300 The Atrium, 1200 N Street, Lincoln,
Nebraska, during normal business hours.

001.03E INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE, 26886 2009 Edition, as
published by the International Code Council, Inc., 5283—fbees—

bR Suite-t08—talie Chureh, —Virgin 220413481 500 New

13
LA P P e & | s e . FHHECy v4.4.\_.:|.u..u..4u,

Jersey Avenue NW, 6th Floor, Washington DC 20001, made a part
hereof by reference with the following revisions and amend-
ments. This code shall be used only for buildings that are not
detached one- and two-family dwellings and multiple single-
family dwellings (townhouses) not more than three stories high
with separate means of egress. A copy of this code is avail-
able to be viewed al the Nebraska Public Service Commission
office at 300 The Atrium, 1200 N Street, Lincoln, Nebraska,
during normal business hours.

001.03E1 In Chapter 1 omit, Secticns 101.1, 102,
103, 104, 105, 106, 107, 108, ard-109_and 110.

001.03E2 Adopt Appendix A,

001.03F INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE, 2088 2009 2009 Edition, as
pub iished by the International Code Council, Inc., 5203

Loaaoghijee Pades C‘nwi "1(10 yyad 'IT«- o SEEY ml’\ 318 seee 2004 24073 500
T Tt o T

I
EEASR R g ot B A A P == e = o dag -4 v..;.a..\j.;..uq.u,

New Jersey Avenue NW, 6th Floor, Washlngton DC 20001, made a
part hereof by reference with the following revisions and
amendments. This code shall be used only for buildings that
are not detached one- and two-family dwellings and multiple
single~family dwellings {townhouses) not more than three
stories high with separate means of egress. A copy of this
code is available to be viewed at the Nebraska Public Service
Commission office at 300 The Atrium, 1200 N Street, Lincoln,
Nebraska, during normal business hours.

001.03F1 In Chapter 1 omit, Sections 101.1, 102,
103, 104, 105, 106, 107, 108, and-109 and 110.

001.03r2 Adopt Appendix A, B and C.

001.03C These standards shall have the same force and effect

as rules and regulations of the Nebraska Public Service Commis-
sion as if set out verbatim in this section, and shall be con-
sidered the State standards in regard to modular housing units.



RULE AND REGULATION No.

Make the fellowing revisions to Rule 002,

002.04,

002.02 Application for Seals:

174 PAGE 7

Seals, subsections 002.02,

G02.05, 002.06, and 002.07.

Any person whe has met the applicable

requirements of Subsection 002.01 shall apply for seals on the a form

prescribed heredirn by the Commission. The-appliestien—shall-be
V== RSN T T I PPN S = oW S, SR Vot S S HE - AWk S IO AT AN 3 aare ke o e £
o ltlt—lu.\.l.i‘ TRy Tt L= gy A== D P M = = g (SRS muwp ¥ v v Tt L= 110 A mup o o
seals—regquested-and a-check—payable—to theNebraska-Publie-Serviee
Compiasion—he—seal—application—formprovidedby—the-Commission—shall
I Ad oo b ) P, T Y n e I
beAEtachment HMOD—023—
002.04 Lost or Damaged Seals:
002.04A When a seal becomes lost or damaged, the Commission
shall be notified immediately in writing by the manufacturer or
dealer. The manufacturer or dealer shall specify the state
seal number lost or damaged.
002.04B All damaged seals shall be promptly returned. Damaged
and--tost seals shall be replaced by the Commission with a new
seal at Commission cost.
002.05 Placement of Seals:
062.05A Each seal shall be assigned and affixed to a Jiwing
medular hcusing unit before its shipment from the manufacturing
plant and a record of sach seal assignment shall be submitted
as set forth in Subsection 002.06.
0G2.05B The seal shall be securely affixed to a lower corner
cf a window.
002.06 Records: Fhe-manufaeturer—shall—submit—a—construction com
Byl et 3 3 o g BRI SRR U~ -1 SHIE - NP oy =y doqaym el gl dt g e Rlembaae o o b Yo Feyan
Pt FRI i Rt u e T et T A e L = e S e AR g e P A R LT TR S Lk S K A S R A S F ORI S
afr—oub-ef-shatemansfacturer;—atlnodutar-housing—units—destined-for
Teaknan -y e de o it Qognt d £33 oot EER W= SR SN S ST T LI =Y L OTATIRA 3 e ERP=N NNy o)
W PRI T L= L e Eg S s g ey L_/J. [N R iy o 4 A= L= | 3 E R Y 8N I R e e i L] 11T == L.}U.Ll,
ER e SR N NP SRR P S S L S AN P e 3. R V=8 SN S O TN =Y Adnde o mlozn mmde o H D 42 o)
.J.ll\j s A1l LJJ_ [=J [F S - W ey LJI LE) AR 108 3% e s s i [E-J A i s 2y LA [ gy w4 T TT = Ll I L T
4k 4 g e o vl i 3 £ g seEf g o e PRV TP =N N N RN S I O P
-Wireh--are—tede—a—part-hereceof by—roefoerence—and-shatlbe——submitied -to
+in C oo 3 PICT: PO - =S N leimer wloare S Fd oo b e 3 FEI seomel EEIN
the sRTssreR-wikihta—t—werking—days—after—theseal—is-affinedtothe

heme- A construction compliance certificate, prescribed by the Com-

mission,

shall be submitted to the Commission by the 10th of each month

after the seal

is affixed to the home. This rule applies to all

Nebraska manufacturers for each unit manufactured in Nebraska and to

all out of state manufacturers with housing units destined for Nebraska

0062.07

Unit Tdentification: Each modular housing unit shall be

assigned a serial number and each major transportable section of the

house shall carry this serial number.
readily wvisible.

The serial number shall be
The following information shall be placed directly or

by reference on one or more permanent manusfaeturerls—data plates as
prescribed by the Commission 4fettaehment—#3} in the vicinity of the

electrical distribution panel or in some other designated location that
is readily accessible for inspection.



RULE AND REGULATION No. 174 PAGE 8

C02.07A Manufacturer's name and address,

002.07B Serial number of the unit.

002.07C Model designation and name of manufacturer of major
factory installed appliances.

002.07D Where applicable, identification of permissible type
of gas for appliances.

002.07E Name and date of standards complied with.

002.07F State seal number.

802.07G Design loads.

002,074 Special conditions or limitations of the unit.
002.07I Date of manufacture.

002.07J Electrical Ratings - instrucltions and warnings on
voltage, phase, size, and connecticns of units and grounding
requirements.

002.07K Insulation Values.

3. Make the following revisions to Rule 003, subsection 003.01.

003 PLAN APPROVAL:

003.01 General Requirements: Applications, plans, and specifications,
and cther documentation shall be submitted as indicated below:

C03.01A All plans and specifications of basic systems or
variations therecf, including all elements relating to specific
components and preoperly identified as relating to said
components, shall be submitted in duplicate and accompanied by
an application for review on a form supplied by the Commission.

Ty pylodo o ds 4 oman L e g y-\v- PPNl D W 2 3 4-h CoTATaa Bhall 1
Ty oPP o Ea T OO TR [ ey e u_y (Pp Ao roRt—S et t—oe

A%%aehmen%—%~+¥@9«@%+« When required by Nebraska Revised

Statutes, §81-3401 to 81-34553, all plans and specifications
submitted to the Commission shall be prepared only by persons
who are registered as professional engineers and architects in
Nebraska,

003.01B A compliance assurance manual (two copies each) shall

be provided with index including but not limited to the fcllow-
ing:

003.01B1 Standards: The manual shall identify which
of the following standards are adhered to by the manu-
facturer as adopted by the State of Nebraska:

003.01Bla TINTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE,
2668 2009 Editicn.

003,.01B1lkh INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE, 2680
2009 Edition.



RULE AND REGULATION No. 174 PAGE &

004

003.01Blc INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE,
2586 2009 Edition.

003.01B1d HNATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE, adopted
by the Nebraska State Electrical Board.

003.01Ble INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE, 2668
2009 Edition.

003.01B1lf INTERNATIONAIL BUILDING CODE, 2068
2009 Edition.

Make the following revisions to Rule 004, subsections 004.01, 004.02,
004.04, 004.05 and renumber existing subsections,

COMPLIANCE ASSURANCE QUALITY CONTROL PROGRAM:

TS Y o E T 5
SR W WY

004.01 General: %he—eempti
I

PEENE I AN MOh ﬁ'l (o A
oo e Ry VIOt

1y ]
gl

it

Coaa e oy
L= e M o v ey v e

shall be the manufacturer's responsibility to execute every aspect of
this the compliance assurance program. The manufacturer shall continue
to be responsible for all corrective actions required. Each manufacturer
must obtain approval of his their compliance assurance program from the
Commission.

= b

t

004,02 Requirements of Manufacturer: The manufacturer of modular
housing units shall submit the following, at a minimum, in duplicate:

004.020 A statement identifying who 1s responsible directly, or
by means of his an agent, for timely and effective performance
of service and repairs related to code compliance.

004.04 Initial and Monitcring In-Plant Ingpection by Inspection
Agencies:

004.04A iInitial In-Plant Inspection: Once a manufacturer's
compliance assurance manual and plans have been approved, the
inspection agency shall perform the initial inspection. The
initial inspection shall consist of the inspection agency making
a station-by-station thorough evaluation of the manufacturer's
operation to assure that the manufacturer is operating in accor-
dance with the criteria set forth in the previously approved
compliance assurance manual and plans. In so doing, the inspec-
tien agency shall utilize the in-plant inspection checklist
specified in Subsection 004.03.

If the manufacturer during the initial inspection is found Lo be
producing units in accordance with the approved compliance
assurance manual and plans, the inspection agency shall notify
the manufacturer, in writing, with a copy being feorwarded to the
Nebraska Public Service Commission.

The notification letter to the manufacturer from the inspection

agency shall be in—the-felltowing—Fferm signed by an authorized

agent of the inspection agency and shall include the following:




RULE AND REGULATION No. 174 PAGE 10

b1 38 SN P e Aoddfar ok
N L e o CAT S L © 8 T oy e o
o Trco + Lo
TNTHI A R e X = LA e g
Ay e e e
Eepresentiid B
Mlom £ Tnomecabtiorn  Derme oy,
LV TOAT E .LXAurJ T ll\j\all\zy
20N R | + b earmia e sl 3o £
7 [~y R Y1 3= A -t pat o ¥ i R v R i 4 R I ML L g e 5 i s
hNESEE EEI ¥ LR c gy
o IR ET R ey
7
Vil Pa EEYNT P o Bornaa £ g ey
EA0 A A Ay L R LAF L& 90 W g g o g wy vap - 0 Y i
FITE L N A T R aemah otk PN S WP~ SO P, S oI ERR =Wk SO AR e el S
S I B LN - Ry I [ = L}lllr}l p L L= ) v e o 3 )./_)' [ T & g Wyl iy TT EEERI= AT L L bJ,U e e LT 4% iy ey
[N P TR
Ty A
E ks Tt P 2 e e e PTCI I = SO I LI T O SEN FINp= B T e né
Lo g P }J R . lll*lll_.j T BN N g ey ERELILS & I Lty T LT uklrJ.L v A o RuTrT (=
CLOTRE e AL Py OB g D by e ), 1 gfomaarade Fow oo .07 oo
U e R G P T et e e e ar R S N e S PO Gt e — S-St e Rdl e ras— o r—-meadn--ar
heovsing—antbsr—and-the
Nom £ = Txramoot d Doz e g
LNCITET £ T A.A.J.ul. L ) TF LR AJ\J'Y
4 EESE RPN - W I T N
TS g T TS CC—T e
Mo L Mamafoambiaaeans
TN T LU R I SV g o ey we e
aan o dadite maaad oot al mepgamaadren 4 e e man £ e e e PO U0 ol S ¢ Y S TP | 1
San—pProeat MO —ReUSIng—uhn3-t5—h Fre-OETc e W NS A S oS

004.04A1 Name of inspection agency.

004.04A2 Name of inspector(s).

004.04A3 Date(s) inspection was performed.

004.04A4 HName and address of manufacturer.

004.04A5 Statement from the inspection agency stating
“A thorough, complete and station-by-station inspection
and evaluation of the manufacturer’s construction and
inspection process was performed in conformance with
its approved plans and compliance assurance manual and
Nebraska’s standards for modular housing units, and the
inspection agency is satisfied that the manufacturer
can produce modular housing units in conformance with
Nebraska standards for modular housing units on an on-
geing basis.”

004.04A6 Signed and dated by an authorized agent of
the inspection agency.

004.04B If the initial inspection reveals deviations from the
previously approved compliance assurance manual and plans, the
inspection agency shall notify the manufacturer, in writing, of
deviations, specifying in detail the observed deviations., A
copy of this letter shall be sent toc the Nebraska Public Service
Commissicn. Upon notification from the plant that the specified
deviations have been corrected, the inspection agency shall



RULE AND REGULATION No. 174 PAGE 11

again make an initial inspection of the plant following the
procedure previcusly outlined in #his section 004.04A.

004.04BC Meonitoring In~Plant Inspections: Following notifica-
tion to a manufacturer under Part C04.04A, the inspection agency
shall undertake monitoring in-plant inspections at a frequency
sufficient to inspect every home that will receive the Nebraska
modular housing unit seal and to assure continuing compliance
with the manufacturer's compliance assurance program. Additional
factors which the inspection agency shalil take into considera-
tion in determining freguency of monitoring in-plant inspections
are as follows:

004.04BC1 Production Volume
004.04BC2 Design Complexity of Units

004.048BC3 The qualifications of the manufacturer's own
in-house compliance centrol organization.

004.04BC4 The experience record of the manufacturer.

€04.042 The monitewing in-plant inspection agency shall utilize
the in-plant inspection check list in Subsection 004.03 to
assure that each construction feature (structural, mechanical,

plumbing, and electrical) is fully evaluated.

004.05 Seal Issuvance: Upon satisfactory completion of the initial in-
plant inspection and #he notification letter issued to the manufacturer
by the inspection agency, the manufacturer shall act in accordance with
the provisions of Section 002.

5. Make the following revisions te Rule 005, subsection 005.01.
005,01 Fees for Seals: One seal is required per %&%&ﬂgwﬁﬂi% modular
housing unit. A—fee—as—established-by-the—Commission—-ofa less—than
PR SR P I | L (S any A1l e AR TR S SR NV o SN SPoC R T ST =S T N P B ) s
SgITey ey (= vy A R s g i e e e L S i o Tt A e LT JPIL.5 15 [P Quians S g g i 5 L 35 0 P I O L o i - e J
(S A 00N 4 RETII R £ I = e ST R U STl Pt | 15N PER W e DR S O oo P I 3 e N N =
Ty oo Py e g it e o 1 LEICTART AL e i [EaT1 & G S AT LS v s S AT S NEE T RS A TS L S~ B )

bepartment=A fee shall be charged for each seal issued by the
Commission for a modular housing unit as established at least annually
after public notice and hearing by the Commission.

6. Make the following revisions to Rule 006, subsection 006.01.

006.01 Procedure to Determine Reciprocity: The Commission shali amend
§ section 006.02, and add to the reciprocity list a state, upon a
showing that the standards, codes and enforcement practices are at
least egual to or are more slringent than those established by the
Commission. Any affected person, may petition the Commission imeluding

any-Stater—may—iaitiate for an amendment pfeeeﬁﬁwﬁﬂdefA%hew%H4e—mak&ﬁq

e ﬂﬁ‘i_ EEE CRE I ‘lOA MNAC ) 1l I pECEPT ) R N e LR PR
.L\Jk4 \Aul = = phe vy i 5 LT = & U.LL_.L) R g L,Lu\,\..l = uxxu L0 O L g S iy
|4 i

pursuvant to the Rules of Commissicn Procedure as codified by state law
and Nebraska Administrative Code, Title 281, Chapter 1. ef-—theNebraska
Pubdde-Service-Semrissten A modular housing unit which bears the seal
of any state which has been placed on the reciprocity list shall not be
reguired to bear the seal issued by this state.




RULE AND REGULATION Wo. 174 PAGE 12

7. Make the following revisions to Rule 007, subsection 007.02.

007.02 Hearings: Any hearings held before the Commission shall be
governed by the Ruies of Commission Procedure as codified by state law
and Nebraska Administrative Code, Title 291, Chapter 1. &ﬁmaeee¥daﬁee

o4
SO

PO 0 W o = P Ay PPV LY o Pt O e I | 3 R O A
Ve LT = Ir E30.5 .0 S | N P R I B B U LA S o w  wery - IS, R g A by ~F R LR S R N i [ vy o g oy =4 R N R R Y% 21 = Ay )
Procedure—of—the-NebraskaPublie Service Commission,—Pitle 201 Chapter
v

3. Make the following revisions to Rule 008, subsecticn 008.01.

008.01 Ad Hoc Committee: The Commission shall utilize an ad hoc advis-
ory committee of four (4) 4 members te review any proposed revisions to
these rules. All ad hoc committee members shall be selected by the
Commission and meet in person, #hreugh via video or telephone confer-

ence, threugh-telephone—eonferenase—ealtl, O through any combination of

the aforementioned methods as determined to be convenient to the
Commission and the ad hoc committes members. The membership shall
consist of, when possible, ef no more than one person from sach of the
following groups (modular heusing unit manufacturer, modular housing
unit retailer, professional engineer or architect, city building
official). Committee members are ineligible for expense reimbursement.

9. Delete the following Attachments in their entirety:

Attachment #1 (MCD-01), Application for Modular Housing Unit Plan
Approval;

Attachment #2 (MOD-02}, Seal Request Form;

Attachment #3 {(MOD-03), Manufacturer’s Data Plate;

Attachment #4 (MOD-04), Construction Compliance Certificate



